County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House '

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers ‘ Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks(@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

October 3, 2019

Mr. Craig Mackay
Sherwin Williams
491 Factory Street
Watertown NY 13601

BID # 2019B-13 NAME: Buildings & Grounds Bid Book - Paint and Paint Supplies

CONTRACT PERIOD: 10/01/2019 through 9/30/2021

Dear Mr. Mackay:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Buildings & Grounds Bid Book.

A. The following documents are required before a Purchase Order is issued:

V' W-g Tax Form and Vendor information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mok duckitsc G
Mark Sachetti :

Purchasing Director
C.  Department, Auditor, Bid File, White’s Lumber
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BID #2019B-13 PAINT (ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN")

BID TABULATION

SHERWIN WILLIAMS

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

BRAND/PRODUCT
CODE BID ITEM

SHERWIN WILLIAMS PROMAR 200 OR
EQUIVALENT (VOLUME SOLIDS MUST MEET

MINUMUM OF 41- 45%) INTERIOR LATEX PAINT

ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN":

FLAT

SEMI-GLOSS

EGG-SHEL

SATIN

SHERWIN WILLIAMS PREPRITE 200 OR
EQUIVALENT INTERIOR LATEX WALL PRIMER,

WHITE ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS PREPRITE PROBLOCK OR
EQUIVALENT INTERIOR & EXTERIOR LATEX WALL

PRIMER SEALER, WHITE ENVIRONMENTALLY
FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS HOTLINE OR EQUIVALENT
FAST DRYING LATEX TRAFFIC MARKING PAINT,
WHITE ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS SHERLINE OR EQUIVALENT

SOLVENT-BASED STRIPING PAINT SPRAY,

HANDICAP BLUE ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY

"GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS A-100 OR EQUIVALENT
EXTERIOR LATEX SATIN, WHITE
ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS SUPERPAINT OR
EQUIVALENT EXTERIOR LATEX SATIN, SUPER

WHITE ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS DTM OR EQUIVALENT
ACRYLIC COATING SEM!-GLOSS
ULTRADEEP/CLEAR TINT BASE

ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS PREPRITE OR EQUIVALENT

BLOCK FILLER, WHITE ENVIRONMENTALLY
FRIENDLY "GREEN"

s

MINWAX WOOD FINISH OR EQUIVALENT OIL-
BASED WOOD STAIN, LOW VOC FORMULA,

QUART, VARIOUS COLORS ENVIRONMENTALLY

FRIENDLY "GREEN"

SHERWIN WILLIAMS "CONTROLS RUST"
AEROSOL PAINT, SUPERACRYLIC SPRAY
ENAMEL, 12 OZ., VARIQUS COLORS

TOTAL GROSS SUM BID PRICING FOR ITEMS 1-11

FOR SPECIALTY PAINTS, PRIMERS, SEALERS, AND [& | .

STAINS

DATE OF AWARD - 9f30/20
PRICE EACH

1 GALLON
CONTAINER

10/1/20 - 9/30f21

PRICE EACH

5 GALLON
CONTAINER

WHITE'S LUMBER
DATE OF AWARD - 9f30f20 10f1/20 - 9/30f21
BRAND/PRODUCT PRICE EACH PRICE EACH
CODE BID ITEM 1GALLON 5 GALLON 1 GALLON 5 GALLON
CONTAINER CONTAINER CONTAINER CONTAINER
1 BEN MOORE ULTRA-
SPEC

N536 $14.25 $71.25 $14.67 $7335
N539 $14.25 $71.25 $14.67 $73.35
N537 $14.25 | $71.25 $14.67 $73.35
N538 $14.25 $71.25 $14.67 $73:35
N534 ' $14.10 $67.87 $14.52 $72.61

BEN MOORE SUR
SEAL 0027 $15.65 $78.25 $16.12 $80.60
INSLX TP2210 $12.40 $62.00 $12.77 $63.85
SEYMOUR 20-649 $6.99 NO BID $7.19 NO BID
N448 $18.45 $92.25 $19.00 $95.00

T
N4g8 $18.45 $92.25 $19.00 $92.95
BEN MOORE "

COROTECH U331 $32.00 4$160.00 $33.92 $169.60

MASON BLOCKFIL
057101 $12.00 $60.00 $12.36 $61.80
MINWAX $8.33/QT $34.99/GAL ] $8.57/QT]| $36.03/CAL

RUSTOLEUM STOPS
RUST $3.98/EA NO BID $4.09/EA NO BID
$199.35 $932.61 $206.22 $965.84
% OFF LIST PRICE 18% % OFF LIST PRICE 18%
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BID #2019B-13 PAINT (ENVIRONMENTALLY FRIENDLY "GREEN")

BID TABULATION

SHERWIN WILLIAMS

WHITE'S LUMBER

ITEM #

DESCRIPTION

AVAILABILITY OF ON-LINE ORDERING

BRAND/PRODUCT
CODE BID ITEM

DATE OF AWARD - 93020
PRICE EACH

1GALLON

CONTAINER
0 i

5GALLON

**PLEASE PROVIDE SPECIFICATIdN SHEETS FOR ITEMS BID**

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BiD RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

Wt 74

/ofyg

PURCHASING

DATE

10/1/20 - 9{30/21
PRICE EACH
1GALLON 5 GALLON

CONTAINER CONTAINER

BRAND/PRODUCT
CODE BID ITEM

DATE OF AWARD - 9f3020
PRICE EACH

1GALLON
CONTAINER

5 GALLON
CONTAINER

10/1/20 - 9/30/21
PRICE EACH
1GALLON 5 GALLON
CONTAINER CONTAINER

YES

Shared\Bids\Buildings and Grounds Bid Book\Paint and Paint Supplies Bid 2019B-13




BID #2019B-13 PAINT SUPPLIES

BID TABULATION
SHERWIN WILLIAMS WHITE'S LUMBER
ITEM # DESCRIPTION * BRAND NAME/PRODUCT CODE BRAND/PRODUCT CODE BID [TEM Dateof Award- | o giz0/ BRAND/PRODUCT CODE BID [TEM Dat:‘,’foA;a'd “ | 1oh2o-go
Price / Each Price [ Each Price | Each

Nylon & Polyester Blend Angle Sash, 11/2" Brush with

1 Hardwood Handle |SW Contractor Series #6509-21513 WOOSTER 8144-11/2 $3.99 $4.19
Nylon & Polyester Blend Angle Sash, 2" Brush with

2 Hardwood Handle SW Contractor Series #6509-21620 WOOSTER 8144-2 $4.19 $4.39
Nylon & Polyester Blend Angle Sash, 2 1/2" Brush with

3 |Hardwood Handle SW Contractor Series #6509-21638 WOOSTER 8144-2 12 $4.99 $5.29
Nylon & Polyester Blend Angle Sash, 3" Brush with

4 __|Hardwood Handle SW Contractor Series #6509-21646 WOOSTER 8144-3 $5.79 $5.99
Nylon & Polyester Blend Flat Sash, 2" Brush with 3

5 Hardwood Handle ) SW Contractor Series #6509-21315 WOOSTER 81472 $4.29 $4.49

6___|Bargain Brush, 1", 100% Polyester, Plastic Handle SW: #182-0562 21101 $1.49 $1.53

7 Bargain Brush, 2", 100% Polyester, Plastic Handle SW: #182-0570 211012 $1.89 $1.99

8 |Bargain Brush, 3", 100% Polyester, Plastic Handle SW: #182-0588 21101-3 $2.79 $2.89

9 Bargain Brush, 4", 100% Polyester, Plastic Handle SW: #182-05696 211014 $5.29 $5.49

10| Bestt Liebco Foam Brush, 1", SW: #180-3162 FOAM 1 $0.25 $0.28

1 Bestt Liebco Foam Brush, 2", SW: #180-3170 FOAM 2 $0.28 $0.32

12__|Roller Cover - Soft Woven, " x 3/8" Thick Nap _ | SW Contractor Series #6509-21836 ‘WR642 $4.92 $4.69

13 | Roller Cover - Soft Woven, 9" x %" Thick Nap SW Contractor Series #6509-21844 WR643 $4.42 $4.69
Roller Cover - Soft Woven, 9" x 3/8" Thick Nap, 3 .

14 |pack SW Contractor Series #6509-21877 WR725 $8.79 38.99

15 | Professional Roller Cover, 6 Pack, g"x %" Thick Nap SW Contractor Series #173-1660 AB06449 $6.99 $7-29]

16| Roller Frame - 9" with Wood Handle, Heavy Duty Purdy - SW# 6508-52080 LINZER 10892 $.29 $239

17__|Roller Tray - Premium Plastic, g" W, 2 Quart SW# 170-9385 WPoo8PP $1.90 $2.19
Scotch-Blue Painters Tape for Multi-Surfaces #2090, 1 .

18 |1/2" x 60 yds SW# 965-8337 L03682 $5.79 $5.99
Scotch-Blue Painters Tape for Multi-Surfaces #2090, 2"

13 |x60yds SW# 821-8034 L03683 $6.19 $6.29

20 | Helix Paint Mixer, 5 gal — Allway #HM5 SW#996-4792 fM772 $10.29 $10.80
Purdy POWER LOCK Professional Grade Extension Pole,

21 14'-8 SW# 6508-43790 - Rogt $31.69 $32.29
Acrylic Latex Caulk, 8504, Interior/Exterior, Paintable,

22 |45 year warranty, 10.1 0z cartridges SW# 151-8273 DAP 18201 $2.11 3219
Drop Cloth, Trimaco, 10 oz Canvas, Finished Seams and

23 |Hems, Heavy Weight, 9' x 12 SWi# 998-5912 912DC $19.99 $20.29
Drop Cloth, Trimaco, 10 0z Canvas, Finished Seams and

24 |Hems, Heavy Weight, 12' x 15’ SW# 998-5938 1215DC $28.99 $29.39
Paint Thinner, Gallon (for oil based paints, vamishes

25 |and enamels) SW#118-4209 PTG $7.99 $8.19

GRAND TOTAL $177.09 $182.52
FOR ITEMS NOT INCLUDED IN THE ABOVE LIST, PLEASE PROVIDE A % DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE 18% DISCOUNT
AVAILABILITY OF ON-LINE ORDERING YES

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS,
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED 8Y THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

/ﬁ////éé/ /e frg

PURCHASING DATE
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